
How can I be an effective witness for Christ in a lost world? 
 
A “witness” is someone who attests to a fact, so in order to be an effective witness for 
Christ, one must have firsthand knowledge of Him. John the Apostle speaks of this in 1 
John 1:1-3, when he says, “That . . . which we have seen with our eyes, which we have 
looked at, and our hands have touched—this we proclaim concerning the Word of Life.” 
Today, we who have experienced new life in Christ give an account of His love and 
forgiveness, both verbally and in the way we live our lives. This is witnessing. To be 
effective in our witness, we should remember several basic things: 
 
1) the THEME of our witness is Jesus Christ. Paul defined the gospel as the death, 
burial, and resurrection of Jesus Christ (1 Corinthians 15:1-4). If we aren’t explaining the 
sacrifice of Christ, then we’re not really sharing the gospel. (See also 1 Corinthians 
2:2 and Romans 10:9-10.) An important part of this theme is the fact that Jesus Christ is 
the only way to salvation, not just one of many ways. “I am the way, the truth and the 
life. No one comes to the Father except through me” (John 14:6). 
 
2) the POWER of our witness is the Holy Spirit. It is the Spirit who transforms a life 
(Titus 3:5), and a transformed life is evident to all. As we witness, we should spend much 
time in prayer, appropriating the Spirit’s power so that we are enabled to let our light 
shine in such a way that others will recognize the power of God in us (Matthew 5:16). 
 
3) the VALIDITY of our witness will be shown in how we live our lives. Philippians 
2:15 sets this goal for us: “That ye may be blameless and harmless, the sons of God, 
without rebuke, in the midst of a crooked and perverse nation, among whom ye shine as 
lights in the world.” The effective Christian witness will live his/her life above reproach in 
the power of the Holy Spirit, whose fruit we exhibit when we remain in Christ (John 15:1-
8; Galatians 5:22-23). 
 
Perhaps most importantly, we must be familiar enough with the Scriptures to be able to 
accurately and coherently present the gospel to others. “Always be prepared to give an 
answer to everyone who asks you to give the reason for the hope that you have” (1 
Peter 3:15). Always being prepared means diligent Bible study, memorizing Scripture, 
and praying for God-given opportunities to share with those whose hearts have been 
prepared by the Lord to hear His message of salvation. 
 

How can I evangelize my friends and family without pushing 
them away?  



At some point, every Christian has had a family member, a friend, co-worker, or 
acquaintance who is not a Christian. Sharing the gospel with others can be difficult, and 
it can become even more difficult when it involves someone with whom we have close 
emotional ties. The Bible tells us that some people will be offended at the gospel (Luke 
12:51–53). However, we are commanded to share the gospel, and there is no excuse for 
not doing so (Matthew 28:19–20; Acts 1:8; 1 Peter 3:15). 

 
So, how can we evangelize our family members, friends, co-workers, and acquaintances? 
The most important thing we can do is pray for them. Pray that God would change their 
hearts and open their eyes to the truth of the gospel (2 Corinthians 4:4). Pray that God 
would convince them of His love for them and their need for salvation through Jesus 
Christ (John 3:16). Pray for wisdom as to how to best minister to them (James 1:5). 
 
We must be willing and bold in our actual sharing of the gospel. Proclaim the message 
of salvation through Jesus Christ to your friends and family (Romans 10:9–10). Always be 
prepared to speak of your faith (1 Peter 3:15), doing so with gentleness and respect. 
There is no substitute for personally sharing the gospel: “Faith comes from hearing the 
message, and the message is heard through the word about Christ” (Romans 10:17). 
 
In addition to praying and sharing our faith, we must also live godly Christian lives in 
front of our friends and family members so they can see the change God has made in us 
(1 Peter 3:1–2). Ultimately, we must leave the salvation of our loved ones up to God. It is 
God’s power and grace that saves people, not our efforts. The best we can do is pray for 
them, witness to them, and live the Christian life in front of them. It is God who gives the 
increase (1 Corinthians 3:6). 
 
 
 


